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0 1.0 -1.0 B- In the Beginning

Pilot Movie

1 0.0 0.0 B+ * The Gathering

Midseason Movie

4 12.5 78.5 A-

Midseason Movie

5 21.1 109.1 B- The River of Souls

Postscript Movie

5 21.3 109.3 C+

Postscript Movie

5 21.4 109.4 B A Call To Arms

1998
01.04

(OK to watch before watching the series, but it has some spoilers. Or
watch it between seasons 4 and 5.) Year 2278 - After the Shadow war,
with Centauri in flames, emperor Londo recounts the events leading up
to the Earth-Minbari War (year 2243), and the war itself. The war started
through a misunderstanding.

1993
02.22

(Watch before series) Year 2257. The Vorlon ambassador, Kosh, is
nearly assassinated when he arrives. Commander Sinclair is the prime
suspect. (Many aspects of B5 are mentioned. Straczynski must have had
it pretty well outlined.)

Thirdspace
1998
07.19

(Watch with the series in chronological order) A telepathic alien artifact
created by the Vorlons opens a door to thirdspace to let a killer species
through by taking over the minds of the B5 crew.

1998
11.08

(Watch with the series in chronological order OR Skip) An archeologist
brings a Soul Hunter soul receptacle to B5 with a billion angry souls who
were taken just before evolving, not dying. They want vengeance on the
hunters and take over the station through a holo-brothel.

Legend Of The
Rangers: To Live And
Die In Star Light

2002
01.19

(OK to skip.) About four years after the war of the Shadows, a small,
decrepit, old ranger ship with a rag-tag crew acts as escort for a large
ship carrying diplomats. They end up alone, carrying the diplomats, and
fighting ships from the Hand, who are supposedly worse than the
Shadows. Might have been a pilot for the failed Babylon 5: Legend of the
Rangers series. 

1999
01.05

(Watch with the series in chronological order) Five years after the
alliance, allies of the shadows attack earth with shadow technology.
Sheridan stops the planet killer "bomb" with a new ship but earth is
poisoned starting a 5 year crusade to find the cure. Sets up  "The
Babylon Project: Crusade" series.
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1 0 1 Season One ("Signs and Portents")  Year=2258

1 1 1 B+

1 2 2 C Soul Hunter

1 3 3 B- Born to the Purple

1 4 4 Infection

1 5 5 Parliament of Dreams

1 6 6 C * Mind War

1 7 7 C War Prayer

1 8 8 C- *

1 9 9 C+

1 10 10 F Believers

1 11 11 C Survivors

1 12 12 B

1 13 13 A * Signs and Portents

1 14 14 C- TKO

1 15 15 A- Grail

1 16 16 B+ Eyes

1 17 17 B Legacies

1 18 18 A+ *?

1 19 19 A- *?

1 20 20 B+ * Babylon Squared

1 21 21 B- Quality of Mercy

1 22 22 B+ * Chrysalis

Midnight on the Firing
Line

1994
01.26

When the Narn attack a Centauri colony, Londo and G'Kar nearly come
to blows. Raiders are attacking transport ships near the station.

1994
02.02

Delenn is in danger when a soul hunter, an alien who captures the souls
of the dying, arrives at the station.

1994
02.09

A beautiful slave seduces Londo and steals a computer file jeapordizing
his career. Garibaldi investigates unauthorized communications.

A-
B+

1994
02.16

An archaeologist who smuggles ancient artifacts onto the station
unleashes a ancient living weapon tuned to Narns.

A-
B+

1994
02.23

Sinclair's old flame, Catherine Sakai, arrives during a weeklong human
and alien religious festival. An assassin is sent to kill G'Kar.

1994
03.02

Talia Winter's old instructor, an experiment victim, is a Psi-Cops manhunt
target and gives her telekinesis when he evolves. G'Kar warns Catherine
against a promising mining planet.

1994
03.09

A vicious pro-Earth group attacks a Minbari poet. Sinclair scrambles to
flush them out. Centauri lovers seek Londo's protection. 

And The Sky Full Of
Stars

1994
03.16

(OK to skip. Most is repeat of prequel info.) Pro-Earthers kidnap and
interrogate Sinclair about what happened when he was missing during
the final battle of the Earth/Minbari war.

Deathwalker
1994
04.20

The station is a hotbed when Sinclair has to protect a war criminal and
immortality serum inventor. Kosh hires telepath Talia to supposedly
oversee a negotiation.

1994
04.27

(SKIP!!) Dr. Franklin asks Sinclair to intermediate with an alien family
who refuse surgery for their dying child because of their religious beliefs.

1994
05.04

(Skipped.) Garibaldi's hits the bottle again after a prolonged abstinence
when he's blamed by some for an accident and an incident in his past.

By Any Means
Necessary

1994
05.11

A docking accident death threatens to spark an illegal strike. G'Kar
confronts Londo when he interferes in a Narn religious ceremony.

1994
05.18

Increased raider activity puts the station on alert. Londo obtains a
priceless Centauri artifact. A mysterious stranger visits the alien
ambassadors.

1994
05.25

(Skip.) Garibaldi's old friend arrives and takes part in a dangerous alien
combat sport. A rabbi helps Ivanova come to terms with her father's
death.

1994
07.06

A traveller comes to B5, seeking the Holy Grail. A series of unexplained
attacks on several Lurkers may be linked to Ambassador Kosh.

1994
07.13

Internal affairs investigates Sinclair about his actions in settling the labor
strike as well as other decisions. Ivanova is confronted by Psi-corps.
Lenier assembles Garibaldie's motorcycle.

1994
07.20

The crew must decide whether to turn a teenage telepath over to Psi
Corps. The body of the Minbari Battle of the Line leader causes an
incident.

A Voice in the
Wilderness part 1

1994
07.27

Seismic activity on the planet near B5 uncovers signs of an extinct alien
civilization. Delenn's old mentor visits. Unrest on Mars intensifies.

A Voice in the
Wilderness part 2

1994
08.03

Sinclair fights two turf battles at once as alien invaders and an Earthforce
captain both claim the planet but Delenn's mentor gets it.

1994
08.10

Babylon 4 returns as abruptly as it vanished, but its reappearance may
bode ill for the future. Delenn receives a momentous offer.

1994
08.17

Franklin investigates a woman's free clinic scam and finds an alien
healing machine. Talia must carry out the telepathic sentence on a
murderer. (An unpleasant story.)

1994
10.26

Delenn enters a crysalis state. A dying man leads Garibaldi to a
discovery that could kill him. Londo receives help in the Narn dispute.
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2 0 23 Season Two ("The Coming Of Shadows")  Year=2259

2 1 23 B * Points of Departure

2 2 24 B- * Revelations

2 3 25 A-

2 4 26 B- A Distant Star

2 5 27 A- Long Dark

2 6 28 A- * A Spider in the Web

2 7 29 A Soul Mates

2 8 30 B+ *

2 9 31 C+ * Coming of Shadows

2 10 32 F+ * GROPOS

2 11 33 B * All Alone in the Night

2 12 34 B+ Acts of Sacrifice

2 13 35 A- Hunter, Prey

2 14 36 B+

2 15 37 B And Now For a Word

2 16 38 B- *

2 17 39 C- Knives

2 18 40 C

2 19 41 B+ * Divided Loyalties

2 20 42 C+ *

2 21 43 D Comes the Inquisitor

2 22 44 A * Fall of Night

1994
11.02 

Sinclair is now an ambassador on Minfar. Sheridan, a battle winner from
the war the Minbari hate, assumes control as a renegade Minbari
warship arrives, threatening trouble.

1994
11.09 

G'Kar brings news of a terrible enemy. Sheridan's sister opens boring old
wounds. Franklin uses unorthodox methods to heal Garibaldi. Delenn
emerges - changed.

Geometry of
Shadows

1994
11.16 

Ivanova is promoted and given a diplomatic assignment sorting out Drazi
fights. Garibaldi is worried about competence. Londo seeks affirmation
from technomages.

1994
11.23 

Dr. Franklin offers nutritional advice to reluctant patients. The new
command is settling in. Sheridan's friend's ship, the Cortez, becomes lost
in subspace and he rescues it.

1994
11.30 

When a cryonic sleeper from 100 yrs ago is awakened, a deadly, evil
force is unleashed on the station. One lurker remembers it.

1994
12.07 

Talia is caught in a treacherous web of intrigue after a she witnesses a
man with electric forces murder her friend who wants a free mars without
warfare.

1994
12.14 

Londo summons his three wives to Babylon 5 to divorce two. Talia's ex-
husband reappears pretending to not have PSI powers.

A Race Through Dark
Places

1995
01.25 

Bester asks Talia to investigate an "underground railroad" of
unregistered telepaths but she thwarts Bester with their help.

1995
02.01 

The Centauri emperor visits to make peace but dies. Londo and Reefa
launch an attack on the Narns using the Shadows. War is declared. The
Rangers show up.

1995
02.08 

(SKIP!) Franklin's father leads 25,000 soldiers thru the station generating
fear that they are on a secret mission that will mak the station an armed
camp.

1995
02.15 

Sheridan is kidnapped and tested by an alien ship. The Grey Council
ousts Delen but she can remain as B5 ambassador. General Hague
visits, debriefs Sheridan and the staff is informed of events.

1995
02.22 

Narns and Centauri fighting on the station. G'Kar asks Sheridan to
intervene on behalf of the Narns. Ivanova institutes an ambassadorship
with a new race.

1995
03.01 

President Clark's surgeon, a fugitive, with sensitive information about the
Earth government flees to Babylon 5. Sheridan gets Kosh to help.

There All the Honor
Lies

1995
04.26 

Sheridan is in hot water when he is framed into killing a Minbari warrior in
self-defense. B5 is merchandised! Kosh starts giving Sheridan lessons.
Londo supports Vir.

1995
05.03 

Babylon 5 is caught in the middle of a deadly conflict between the Narn
and Centauri; as seen through the eyes of an ISN reporter who tours the
station.

In the Shadow of
Z'ha'dum

1995
05.10 

Sheridan illegally interrogates Morden about the death of his wife. Delen
tells him about the Shadows. Narn refugees indundate the station. A new
Earth agency recruits personnel for the Nightwatch.

1995
05.17 

(SKIP.) An old acquaintance tricks Londo into a sword fight to the death
to save his family. Sheridan is plagued by visions from a lifeform in his
body that wants to go home.

Confessions and
Lamentations

1995
05.24 

The outbreak of a disease among the Markab population prompts a
panic on the station; Dr. Franklin races against time to find a cure.

1995
10.11 

Lyta Alexander, the station's first telepath, returns with a warning that a
Babylon 5 officer is a latent Psi-Corp spy. (Talia - a villain to love.)

Long, Twilight
Struggle

1995
10.18 

The Centauri destroy the Narn world with mass drivers. Sheridan is
offered assistance by the Minbari who merged with the B5 planet. G'kar
has sanctuary on B5 but is not ambassador. Rangers introduced.

1995
10.25 

(Skipped.) Kosh summons an ancient inquisitor to test Delenn's
allegiance via torture. G'Kar tries to rally the Narn on Babylon 5.

1995
11.01 

A Narn cruiser seeks B5 help. Sherridan destroys a Centauri ship.
Centari expands the war. Kosh reveals himself to save Sheridan. Keffer's
discovery of a Shadow ship is revealed to all.  



B5-quick-ref.xls  02/11/2021 Page 4

S SE Play # Gd Title date  Summary
A Babylon 5 Quick Reference Guide by SciFiOne 2005

3 0 45 Season Three ("Point of No Return")  Year=2260

3 1 45 A- * Matters of Honor

3 2 46 B+ Convictions

3 3 47 C A Day in the Strife

3 4 48 D-

3 5 49 A+ * Voices of Authority

3 6 50 A * Dust to Dust

3 7 51 B+

3 8 52 A- * Messages from Earth

3 9 53 B+ * Point of No Return

3 10 54 A+ * Severed Dreams

3 11 55 C+

3 12 56 B+

3 13 57 B-

3 14 58 B+ * Ship of Tears

3 15 59 C- *

3 16 60 A+ *

3 17 61 A *

3 18 62 A+ Walkabout

3 19 63 Grey 17 Is Missing

3 20 64 B-

3 21 65 B+ * Shadow Dancing

3 22 66 A *

1995
11.06 

Sheridan uses a new Minbari/Vorlon ship, the Whitestar, to rescue
Rangers and destroy a shadow ship. War council started. Londo learns
the consequences of the Shadows. Morden goes to earth.

1995
11.13 

Ivanova calls on some unusual investigators to stop a mad bomber who
threatens B5 and traps Londo and G'Kar in an elevator. 

1995
11.20 

An alien probe wants 600 answers or it will destroy B5. A Narn emmisary
wants G'kar to return but he doesn't. Vir goes to Minbar Franklin is
addicted to stims.

Passing Through
Gethsemane

1995
11.27 

Lyta Alexander returns to the station, altered by the Vorlons, working for
Kosh's (good tertiary story). One of Theo's brothers discovers that he is a
mind wiped serial killer (bad primary story).

1996
01.29 

Ivanova used Dhral's machine and contacts a first one for war help. A
Nightwatch political advisor shows up and causes hassels and eliminates
freedoms.

1996
02.05 

An addictive telepathy drug is found on the station, prompting Bester
(powers blocked) and Garibaldi to work together. G'Kar takes it, blows
Londo's mind and becomes more advanced himself.

Exogenesis
1996
02.12 

Marcus & Franklin fight aliens they think are parasites that attach to
humans. They are actually memory recording health giving symbionts.

1996
02.19 

A shadow ship is found on ganymeade forcing Sheridan to act against
Earth to destroy it. Nightwatch and the shadows tighten their grip on
everyone. Earth declares martial law.

1996
02.26 

Marshal law is declared and earthgov falls apart. Zack's loyalties tested
when the Nightwatch takes over security. Sheridan arrests them and
hires Narns for security.

1996
04.01 

President Clark tries to seize control of Babylon 5 by force. Sheridan
declares independence and a earth attacks vigorously. Delenn forces
Minbar to join the fight.

Ceremonies of Light
and Dark

1996
04.08 

The Nightwatch kidnaps Delenn in an attempt to return B5 to Earth
control. Londo presents Refa with an ultimatum by poisoning him.
Sheridan and Delenn in love. New independent B5 uniforms.

Sic Transit Vir
1996
04.15 

Vir rescues Narns, gets "married" and separated. The heavy influx of
Narns to the station raised suspicions about it.

A Late Delivery From
Avalon

1996
04.22 

Sheridan and Ivanova set up a defense agreement with the unaligned
worlds. A disturbed soldier claiming to be King Arthur arrives and helps
the lurkers while seeking a cure for himself.

1996
04.29 

Bester and B5capture a Shadow cargo ship and find humans are their
ship's living computers. G'kar is admitted to the group. Telepaths can
destroy Shadows who are now attacking openly.

Interludes and
Examinations

1996
05.06 

Sheridan gets Kosh to fight Shadows so worlds will unite. Morden kills
Londo's wife & Kosh. Franklin acknowledges his addiction, resigns.

War Without End,
Part One

1996
05.13 

Sinclair returns to pull Babylon 4 1000 years back through time with help
of Zathras and the B5 planet. Sheridan ends up trapped 19 years in the
future on Centauri.

War Without End,
Part Two

1996
05.20 

Sinclair takes B4 back 1000 yrs to save Minbar & metomorphoses into
the minbari Valen. Sheridan sees his future & Londo's sad future.

1996
09.30 

Dr. Franklin starts a walkabout Downbelow to discover his place in life.
Lyta and Sheridan successfully test using telepathy against shadows.

B-
C+

1996
10.07 

Delenn agrees to lead the Rangers, but Marcus must protect her from
the warrior cast. Garibaldi investigates a secret level of the station.

And the Rock Cried
Out, No Hiding Place

1996
10.14 

Z minus 14 days. Londo uses G'Kar & Vir to kill Reefa & gain power at
home. Religious leaders help Sheridan who is consumed analysis of
Shadow strategies. There is a White Star fleet.

1996
10.21 

Z minus 7 days. Sheridan launches a preemptive strike against the
Shadows. Franklin is stabbed while trying to do a good deed - returns to
work. Delenn watches Sheridan sleep. Z minus 2 days.

Z'ha'dum (part 1)
1996
10.28 

Sheridan's wife shows up and he goes to Z'ha'dum with her. Londo is
promoted so the emperor can watch him. The Shadows bring a fleet to
B5 but leave when Sheridan blows up Z'ha'dum.
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4 0 67 Season Four ("No Surrender, No Retreat")  Year=2261

4 1 67 B+ *

4 2 68 C+

4 3 69 C- * The Summoning

4 4 70 A- *

4 5 71 C * The Long Night

4 6 72 B+ * Into the Fire

4 7 73 B+ * Epiphanies

4 8 74 D The Illusion of Truth

4 9 75 A- * Atonement

4 10 76 A- Racing Mars

4 11 77 B

4 12 78 B+  + Conflicts of Interest

4 13 79 B+

4 14 80 C+ *

4 15 81 B *

4 16 82 C+  +

4 17 83 C *

4 18 84 F

4 19 85 A- *

4 20 86 A * Endgame (pt 3) (pt G)

4 21 87 B  +

4 22 88 B

The Hour of the Wolf
(part 2)

1996
11.04 

Ivanova, Delenn, and Lyta search Z'ha'dum for Sheridan. The Alliance
begins to unravel.  Cartagia is insane- Shadows move to Centauri-
Londo plots his removal. G'Kar searches for Garibaldi.

Whatever Happened
to Mr. Garibaldi?

1996
11.11 

G'Kar is captured and given to Londo who makes a deal with him.
Delenn urges the Rangers to strike against the Shadows. Sheridan talks
to the First One. OK TO SKIP.

1996
11.18 

Ivanova and Marcus try to find the First Ones but find Vorlons who are
destroying any planet with Shadows. Delenn's attack plan runs into
trouble until Sheridan returns during a meeting. 

Falling Toward
Apotheosis

1996
11.25 

Kosh is pulled from Sheridan & kills the "new Kosh." G'Kar looses an
eye.  Vorlon war against the Shadows upped. Garibaldi is acting odd. 

1997
01.27 

On Narn, with G'Kar's help, Londo and Vir kill Cartagia. A trap is set for
the Vorlons and Shadows and the Army of Light prepares to strike.
Ivanova and Lorien look for more First Ones. 

1997
02.03 

The Army of Light moves against the Shadows. Londo destroys the
shadows on Centauri prime. The "younger races" now understand and
the Shadows, Vorlons and First Ones leave.

1997
02.10 

Clark starts his campaign against B5 with a blockade. Bester asks to go
to Z'ha'dum to recover Shadow technology but Lyta blows it up. Garibaldi
resigns as security chief.

1997
02.17 

ISN sends a President Clark controlled news team to do a second story
about Babylon 5. The result is not flattering. SKIPPED.

1997
02.24 

Delenn's clan forces her to do a Dreaming on Minbar to prove she can
marry Sheridan. (Minbari have human DNA). Franklin & Marcus go
secretly to Mars. G'Kar gets a cool new eye.

1997
04.21 

Franklin and Marcus arrive on Mars to begin their undercover mission.
Sheridan confronts Garibaldi about his behavior. Garibaldi joins the
"other side" and works independently.

Lines of
Communication

1997
04.28 

Franklin and Marcus convince rebel leaders to go along with Sheridan.
Delenn checks on attacks and finds the Drac, Shadow assistants. Minbar
approaches civil war and Delenn goes home.

1997
05.05 

Garibaldi takes on a new job that ends with 3 bodies. B5 starts
propaganda broadcasts telling their side. Sheridan asks G'Kar and
Londo to support his plan to protect the other worlds.

Rumors, Bargains
and Lies (pt 1) (pt A)

1997
05.12 

Sheridan tricks the Non-Aligned Worlds into asking for his defense plan.
Delenn tries to get the warrior cast to stop the Minbari civil war.

Moments of
Transition (pt 2) (pt B)

1997
05.19 

Delenn wins by surrendering and forms a new council with a worker
majority. A financially desperate Lyta joins Psycorps after Bester tricks
her and Garibaldi. Sheridan declares war against Earth.

No Surrender, No
Retreat (pt C)

1997
05.26 

Sheridan's forces attack and liberate Proxima 3. Some earth forces join
B5. Londo begs G'Kar to back Sheridan with him.

The Exercise of Vital
Powers (pt D)

1997
06.02 

Garibaldi meets Edgars, learns a little about the telepaths & agrees to
capture Sheridan. Lyta helps Franklin awaken the Shadow telepaths.

The Face of the
Enemy (pt 1) (Pt E)

1997
06.09 

Garibaldi captures Sheridan for Edgars/Clark, learns of the telepath
virus, & reports to Bester. Franklin delivers Shadow telepaths to Mars.
Lyta warns of a mundane-telepath war.

Intersections in Real
Time (skipped)

1997
06.16 

An entire show with Sheridan tortured and questioned by and inquisitor
from Earthdome. Pretty much a complete waste of air time. (SKIP)

Between the
Darkness and the
Light (pt 2) (pt F)

1997
10.06 

Garibaldi is captured & helps rescue Sheridan with Lyta & Franklin.
Ivanova's fleet takes out Clark's warships. Ivanova is mortally wounded.
The League votes to help in the fight.

1997
10.13 

Sheridan's forces make their final strike using the Shadow telepaths to
disable Earth ships. Clark suicides. Marcus dies using the healing
machine on Ivanova.

Rising Star (pt 4) (pt
H)

1997
10.20 

Sheridan is forced to resign Earthforce, is made president of the new
Interstellar Alliance, & marries Delenn. Ivanova leaves as captain of a
new ship. Garibaldi finds Lise.

The Deconstruction of
Falling Stars

1997
10.27 

A Ranger in the distant future looks back at the repercussions of the B5
crew's actions 100, 500, 1000, and 1000000 years in the future.
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5 0 89 Season Five ("Wheel of Fire")     Year=2262   * were marked by me.

5 1 89 B-  + No Compromises

5 2 90 C-

5 3 91 A-

5 4 92 A+

5 5 93 C Learning Curve

5 6 94 B-  + Strange Relations

5 7 95 D+  + Secrets of the Soul

5 8 96 B- Day of the Dead

5 9 97 C+  +

5 10 98 B-  +

5 11 99 D+  + Phoenix Rising (pt 3)

5 12 100 B+ * The Ragged Edge

5 13 101 B+

5 14 102 B

5 15 103 B+ * Darkness Ascending

5 16 104 C- *

5 17 105 A- *

5 18 106 C- *

5 19 107 B+  + Wheel Of Fire

5 20 108 B+ Objects In Motion

5 21 109 C- Objects At Rest

5 22 110 B- Sleeping In The Light

1998
01.21

Captain Lochley takes over B5. Sheridan is sworn in as president during
an assassination attempt. A group of pacifist telepaths arrives looking for
sanctuary. Garibaldi heads intelligence.

The Very Long Night
of Londo Molari

1998
01.28 

Londo suffers a serious heart attack & must face his fears & apologize in
his dreams. Lenier leaves to start training as a Ranger. (OK to SKIP)

The Paragon of
Animals

1998
02.04

The League ambassadors won't sign G'Kar's declaration of principles
until one of them is caught attacking neighbors. Garibaldi enlists the aid
of the refugee telepaths with Lyta's help.

A View from the
Gallery

1998
02.11

Everything is seen from the POV of two ordinary crewmen, Mack and Bo,
as they keep the station running durimg an alien attack.

1998
02.18

A new maniacal crime boss hurts a Ranger trainee and the Rangers fight
back. Lochley's relationship with Sheridan is questioned. (OK to skip)

1998
02.25 

Bester tries to retrieve the refugee telepaths. Lochley delays him. Lyta
joins them. Garibaldi learns of Sheridan's and Lochley's marriage. Delen
chooses G'Kar as Londo's bodyguard.

1998
03.04 

Franklin discovers the Hyach killed off a co-race and doomed
themselves. Bullies beat a telepath. Byron mates with Lyta and learns
the telepaths were created by the Vorlons.  (OK to SKIP)

1998
03.11 

The crew caught in the Brakiri "night" of the dead are visited by dead
friends. The entertainers Rebo and Zooty visit the station.

In the Kingdom of the
Blind (pt 1)

1998
03.18 

Alliance ships are being attacked. The telepaths threaten to reveal
Alliance secrets and lock themselves up after violence. Londo and G'Kar
go to Centauri and find the Court insane. (OK to skip)

A Tragedy of
Telepaths (pt 2)

1998
03.25 

The loose telepaths start fighting. The attacks on Alliance ships continue.
Londo and G'Kar rescue a forgotten Narn from a cell and return to B5.
Bester arrives after Lochley calls him. (OK to Skip)

1998
04.01

The free telepaths take medlab hostage. Byron gets there, stops it and
makes a deal. Bester interferes. Byron and the guilty suicide. Lyta takes
over the telepaths? PSI corps is bombed. (OK to skip)

1998
04.08

Garibaldi gets a clue pointing to the Centauri raiders on Drazi. He is
drinking. G'Kar's published book has has made him a profit. Steven plans
to leave.

Corps is Mother,
Corps is Father

1998
04.15

A look at PSI-Corps from the inside as Bester chases a schizophrenic
telepathic killer to B5. PSI-Corps is Evil! Garibaldi is a drunk again.

Meditations On The
Abyss

1998
05.27

Lenier goes on a training/spy mission for Delen & does well with a weak
recruit. Londo promotes Vir to ambassador. Vir takes on a Drazi.

1998
06.03

Lise tries to dry out Garibaldi. Lenier finds the Centauri raiders, records
an attack. Lyta strikes a deal with G'kar - her DNA for ships & money.

And All My Dreams
Torn Asunder

1998
06.10

Centauri guilt is revealed to the council. A blockade is ordered. Garibaldi
screws up and war is declared when the blockade is broken. Londo and
G'kar are imprisoned on Centauri Prime.

Movements Of Fire
and Shadow (pt A)

1998
06.17

Near Minbar, Delen is attacked, stranded in hyperspace. Franklin and
Lyta (she is hot) on Drazi world - Centauri framed with Shadow tech.
Drazi and Narn attack defenseless Centauri Prime.

Fall Of Centauri
Prime (pt B)

1998
10.28

The Drach take Centauri & Londo, who surrenders to stop the war, &
rescues Delen to become emperor. The Centauri leave the Alliance to
stand alone.

1998
11.04

Lyta arrested for bombing PSI Corps. Garibaldi caught drunk, is
suspended, makes deal with Lyta to free her & take down PSI corps.
G'kar & Lyta to leave and explore. Delen is pregnant.

1998
11.11

The BoD tries to kill Garibaldi & Lise- they marry & turn the tables. A nut
tries to kill G'Kar.  G'kar & Lyta leave. Garibaldi leaves for Mars.

1998
11.18

Franklin leaves quietly. G'Kar's replacement shows up. Delen, Sheridan,
Lanier leave. Lanier flips out, tries to kill Sheridan. Londo meets them
and leaves a Drach "gift" for their son. (OK to skip.)

1998
11.25

20 years later, Sheridan's time to die, calls his friends, goes for a "drive"
and "disappears." Ivanova now Rangers leader. B5 visited one last time
and "decommissioned." (OK to skip - Watch Credits)


